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Afterword

JOHN CHRISTIAN LAURSEN

The chapters in this book have explored numerous heterodox clandes-
tine philosophical manuscripts in their diverse contexts in Europe from 
1620 to 1822. The history of this philosophical literature serves as a com-
plement to the histories of philosophy and of subversive ideas that have 
concentrated on the main printed works. It turns out that significant 
philosophical and even scientific work was taking place underground, 
in the manuscripts that were written and circulated in this period. They 
were usually underground because they were subversive of church or 
state or both. This afterword situates this body of philosophical manu-
scripts in its context of other sorts of manuscript and print publication 
and of other reasons for clandestinity.

One thing we can emphasize here is the heterogeneity of the manu-
scripts and of their fortuna. Some were written for the exclusive use of 
the author, some just for friends, some were clearly written for narrow 
circles of elite intellectuals, some for a wider public, some for posterity 
perhaps conceived in decades or centuries. Some were short and some 
were very long. Some were occasional pieces, dashed off in a few days or 
weeks, some represented years of hard work, and some were the product 
of a lifetime of reflection. Some were quite original, and others were 
pastiches of other people’s ideas. Some were written entirely as an intel-
lectual or moral exercise, and some were written as potboilers for the 
growing market in subversive literature. Some of the authors were well 
aware that wealthy and influential people like Queen Christina of Swe-
den, Prince Eugene of Savoy, and Count Otto Thott of the Danish court 
had authorized agents all over Europe to purchase clandestine manu-
scripts for them. Some even repackaged subversive manuscripts with new 
titles to sell them again to the same careless buyers.
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398	 Clandestine Philosophy

The authors were a wide range, too. Some were state officials, some 
churchmen, some private intellectuals, and some are unknown to us. 
Some were urban, some lived in small villages or country towns. Some 
wrote only manuscripts, and some wrote both published works and clan-
destine manuscripts. Some of the manuscripts were published almost 
immediately, some were published decades after being written and circu-
lating in manuscript, some took centuries to appear in print, and some 
have never been printed. We have found them across Europe, and sus-
pect that some may be found on other continents.

The variety is almost endless. Some of the manuscripts were quite phil-
osophical, but others were rather superficial. If it may be asserted that 
the manuscripts that dealt with sexuality were not directly philosophical, 
it may be answered that the personal and pornographic have always been 
political and philosophical in their impact and implications. Even the 
superficial manuscripts could have an impact in making fun of church, 
state, traditions, and any other authorities.

And this is, in fact, one of the main things that ties the manuscripts 
together. They are all critical of something. An anodyne encomium to 
nature or celebration of a person would not count as a clandestine het-
erodox manuscript, even if it had a bit of philosophy in it. There has to 
be, at least prima facie, a reason why they were circulated clandestinely. 
And that was almost always some element of subversion, of threat to 
someone in a position to retaliate. If we may follow up on the theme of 
diversity, multiplicity, variety in the manuscripts, we see that as a whole 
they also promote diversity, multiplicity, and variety in social and intellec-
tual life. As it has been felicitously put, many of them reject the “monos” 
of monogamy, monotheism, and monarchy. Some of the manuscripts 
explored some of the variety that may be found in sexuality, including 
polygamy. No one has yet identified the precise limits of the sexual het-
erogeneity found in the manuscripts taken together: we need to know 
how far the authors of this corpus were willing to go, and what their limits 
were. As for religion, many of the manuscripts reveal toleration of plural-
ity, and a few even argue for atheism. There are paradoxes such as that 
Spinoza, the great philosophical monist who would brook no multiplicity 
of truths, actually encouraged multiplicity in interpretations of religion. 
Is it tolerant or is it intolerant to insist, as he did, that everyone agree 
with a list of religious truths, but then allow everyone to interpret them 
their own way?1 Something similar can be said for the rejection of mon-
archy: was it complete, or were they just rejecting particular monarchies 
or forms of monarchy? When they promoted republicanism, was this a 
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backward-looking Roman republicanism, a Christian republicanism, or 
some forward-looking republicanism that has yet to be described in the 
scholarly literature? If monarchy is rejected, is that in favour of polyarchy 
or anarchy? Small groups of what seem to be anarchists, known as the 
Levellers, existed in England during the Civil War. Did any of their ideas 
and practices make it into clandestine philosophical manuscripts? We 
still do not know the limits of the political pluralism and heterogeneity 
of the clandestine manuscripts.

Clandestine and Heterodox Print

Many scholars have studied the clandestine printed literature of the 
seventeenth and eighteenth centuries, some of which circulated under-
ground because it might or did draw the ire of church and state author-
ities. So, for example, Robert Darnton has studied what he calls “the 
literary underground of the Old Regime” and “the forbidden bestsellers 
of pre-revolutionary France.”2 Many of the texts he studied owed their 
notoriety to pornography, not philosophy. But his idea of the “corpus of 
clandestine literature in France, 1769–1789” is almost entirely printed 
materials.3 His specialty is “publishing and sedition,” not the unpub-
lished but sometimes widely circulated seditious manuscripts we have 
studied here.4 There is no doubt that, as he puts it, state censorship 
“shaped literature” in the seventeenth and eighteenth centuries, but he 
does not consider the manuscript literature at any length, and that is 
what we have done here.5

Other genres of printed literature could be heterodox and clandes-
tine and subject to censorship and repression just as much as our manu-
scripts. Simon Dickie has studied the forgotten comic literature of the 
eighteenth century. He found a vast corpus of comic novels, jestbooks, 
farces, and cartoons subversive of church, state, and everything else, but 
most of it was printed, not manuscript, and again, not very philosophical 
like our texts.6

Other Types of Manuscripts

Clandestine and heterodox philosophical manuscripts were only a sub-
set of all manuscripts in this period. Until the invention of the printing 
press, of course, all writings circulated in manuscript form. The inven-
tion of the printing press by no means obliterated the continuing prac-
tice of circulating manuscripts. Harold Love provided a survey of what he 

[1
48

.1
35

.8
3.

86
]  

 P
ro

je
ct

 M
U

S
E

 (
20

24
-1

1-
23

 1
1:

51
 G

M
T

)



400	 Clandestine Philosophy

called “scribal publication in seventeenth-century England” that made 
the point that many seventeenth-century English poets such as Donne, 
Corbett, Marvell, Philips, Traherne, and Rochester wrote primarily for 
manuscript transmission.7 Other manuscripts in circulation included 
newsletters, weekly accounts of what was going on at court, and reports 
of the speeches in Parliament, often in multiple manuscripts.8 These 
were not, of course, the philosophical manuscripts we have considered 
in this volume. Love’s later work on satire demonstrated that printed 
texts and manuscripts often existed side by side, and were clandestine 
because of the explosive nature of their contents, but again, they were 
not philosophical manuscripts.9

The sheer numbers of manuscripts in the period are impressive. Peter 
Beal provided an index in four volumes of the sorts of literary manu-
scripts that were circulating in England in the years 1450 to 1700.10 Pre-
sumably similar numbers could be found in French, German, Latin, and 
maybe other languages. If the number of manuscripts is smaller in some 
of the less widespread languages that does not necessarily mean they 
were less important for their populations.

Manuscript publication was sometimes used by women because of 
cultural norms that discouraged them from appearing in the mascu-
line print sphere. But recent work has brought out the point that there 
were many other reasons why a woman might publish in manuscript 
even though she could have published in print.11 As George Justice 
pointed out, scribal publication remained, even as late as the end of 
the eighteenth century, a viable “alternative mode of publication” along-
side print.12 It has been pointed out that manuscripts could acquire the 
cachet of exclusivity and elite forbidden pleasure that public print could 
not provide.13

Beyond the Core Languages

The final section of this volume consists of chapters on the reception 
or afterlife of the heterodox clandestine literature in Spain in the early 
nineteenth century. One special dimension of this section is the point 
that Spain may have been one of the last places anyone would have 
looked for heterodox literature, famous as it was for the Inquisition and 
monarchic government. But it turns out that given porous borders, inef-
ficient policing, and education and travel abroad, a surprising amount 
of subversive literature came in during the eighteenth century, mostly 
from France.14 And there were plenty of people who were eager to take 
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advantage of what has been called the “liberal Triennium” from 1820 to 
1823 in which de facto freedom of the press existed because of a num-
ber of political contingencies, including the Napoleonic invasion and its 
aftermath.

Similar work should be undertaken for all of the countries in Europe. 
We do not know enough about the reception, even decades later, of this 
literature in all of the countries outside the hotbeds of France, Germany, 
Britain, and the Netherlands. For example, we know that Spinoza’s 
books and some Spinozana were held in the library of one the members 
of the Danish Privy Cabinet, Count Otto Thott.15 Printed material from 
the period is largely abusive of Spinoza. But there may have been Spi-
nozistic and other heterodox manuscripts circulating as well. This is one 
of the many open questions about the clandestine material in countries 
outside the central four mentioned above.

We should also look to other continents. For example, there was 
an Enlightenment expressed in printed texts in Nueva Granada (now 
Colombia).16 Other work has foregrounded the development of subver-
sive social and political concepts such as “Republic” and “Revolution” 
in the printed press in a dozen Latin American countries from 1750 to 
1870.17 This work should be supplemented by a search for manuscripts. 
We need to ask: did any of the clandestine literature circulate there? It 
could be imports, translations, or home-grown heterodoxy.

Modern Editions and Scholarship

There is an excellent series in French of modern editions of clandestine 
texts such as by Fontenelle, César Chesneau Du Marsais, and Abraham 
Gaultier edited by Antony McKenna and published by the Voltaire Foun-
dation at Oxford.18 Unfortunately, it has ceased publication. Fortunately, 
McKenna continues to edit a series with Honoré Champion in Paris that 
includes editions of clandestine manuscripts from time to time; it has 
now grown to more than seventy volumes.19 In German there are two 
series edited by Winfried Schröder.20 We need more such series to bring 
many of these manuscripts to wider attention. More translations of the 
French, German, and Latin texts into English would be an excellent idea.

As of 2017 perhaps the most important means of accessing some of 
the philosophical manuscripts is the collection of PDFs made available as 
“L’Inventaire des manuscrits philosophiques clandestins (IMPC)” at the 
Bibliothèque Mazarine in Paris: https://www.bibliotheque-mazarine.
fr/impc. We can hope that more and more manuscripts will be made 
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available in the near future. That will not obviate, but rather encourage, 
the translation into other languages of many of these manuscripts.

The latest scholarly discoveries may be found in the two periodicals 
dedicated to the area, La lettre clandestine (1992–present) and Libertinage 
et philosophie au XVIIe siècle (1996–present). Note that these are published 
in French, but the materials explored in this volume suggest that there 
should be much more attention to this area in journals published in Eng-
lish, German, Spanish, and other languages. New work is coming out all 
the time that adds to our understanding of the interplay of clandestine 
manuscripts and culture.21

The history of philosophy, the history of political ideas, the history of 
sexuality, the history of modernity, the history of atheism, and the history 
of many other things cannot be written adequately without reference to 
the manuscript tradition underlying the print culture of the seventeenth 
and eighteenth centuries. There is too much evidence that the writers of 
the printed texts read and thought about these manuscripts to dismiss 
them. The very fact that many well-known printed works circulated in 
manuscript for decades before being published suggests that we need to 
know more about their pre-print-publication impact. The essays in this 
volume should provide a good starting place for further work.
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